
FOR SALE
£675,000



Drove Lane, Cold Ash

DESCRIPTION
Nestled in a sought-a�er, tucked-away posi�on down a private road in the
desirable village of Cold Ash, this spacious 3/4 bedroom detached bungalow offers
a rare opportunity to acquire a versa�le home with enormous poten�al. Cold Ash,
situated just north of Newbury, is renowned for its strong community spirit,
boas�ng a village hall, post office, and excellent school catchments including St.
Mark’s and St. Finian’s Primary Schools, and The Downs School in Compton, which
holds an excellent Ofsted reputa�on.

The property occupies a secluded plot and, while in need of refurbishment,
provides tremendous scope for extension or reconfigura�on (subject to the
necessary planning consents). The exis�ng layout offers flexible accommoda�on
comprising: an entrance porch opening to a central hallway, a u�lity room, fi�ed
kitchen, two well-propor�oned bedrooms, and a family bathroom. A recep�on
room leads into a substan�al lounge featuring a vaulted ceiling, exposed brick
fireplace, and a wood-burning stove — the heart of the home. Stairs ascend to an
addi�onal recep�on area with vaulted ceiling, Velux windows, and a glass
par��on, offering ideal space for a study, studio, or addi�onal living area. A
further bedroom and shower room are accessed via a separate staircase, making
this area perfect for guest accommoda�on or a private suite.

Outside, the property enjoys a generous and mature rear garden, beau�fully
stocked with a variety of shrubs, flowers, and plants. A lawn and pa�o area
provide the perfect se�ng for outdoor entertaining and alfresco dining. A
driveway leads to a detached single garage, offering ample parking and storage.
This is a superb opportunity for those looking to create a bespoke home in a
pres�gious and peaceful village se�ng. 

ENERGY EFFICIENCY RATING



£675,000



NO ONWARD CHAIN

Ground floor accommodation:-

Entrance porch

Large triple aspect living room

Dining room

Kitchen

Utility room

Two double bedrooms

Bathroom

Lower ground floor:-

Large main bedroom with ensuite suite shower
room

First floor:-

Guest bedroom

Garage and driveway parking


