
 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 



 

 

Description – (Approx 1896 sq ft) 

Cooper and Tanner are delighted to offer this 
fantastic opportunity to purchase this outstanding 
and immaculately presented detached residence. 

This wonderful home is located on the popular 
Crockerton side of the town and is also positioned 
close to the established nature reserve, and 
countryside / woodland walks. 

 This property offers generous living 
accommodation that is ideal for a growing family 
and is presented in beautiful condition. The home 
has the advantage of backing onto fields and 
having outstanding far-reaching views over grazed 

fields at the rear and beyond. The accommodation 
comprises a storm porch have an arch and door to 
the main galleried entrance hall with stairs to the 
first floor, and access to the ground floor shower 
room and WC.  

The sitting room has a feature fireplace with wood 

surround and marble, sliding doors open to the 
substantial conservatory with tiled flooring and 
doors to the outside. The kitchen is complimented 

with a wide range of panelled wall and base units 
with marble tops and various integrated appliances 

including a hob, oven and dishwasher. The 
separate dining room also has sliding doors that 
give direct access to the conservatory. 

On the first floor a landing gives access to the 
generous four bedrooms, master en-suite and the 
family bathroom. Three of the bedrooms have 

fitted wardrobes. 

Outside 

At the front a private driveway offers ample 
parking and gives access to the double garage. 

The front garden has a level lawn area along with 
hedging, planting and various shrubs. At the rear 

is a beautiful, landscaped garden that incorporates 
lawn, young trees, planted borders and pathways. 
A patio area provides a good seating and BBQ 
area. 

Garage 

Double garage with two up and over doors, power 
and light. There is a door to the rear garden with a 
window to the side  

 

Viewing – By appointment only  

 

   

 
  

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

  

  



 

 

 



 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Location 

 
The historic market town of Warminster on 

the western edge of Sailsbury Plain, offers a 

wide range of shopping including Waitrose, 

Lidl and Morrisons and leisure facilities 

including library, sports centre, Snap gym, 

swimming pool, churches, doctors' and 

dentists' surgeries, hospital, and post office.  

 

There is a wide selection of both state and 

private schools in the area, including 

Warminster School, Dauntsey’s, Port Regis, 

Hazlegrove, King's Bruton, Salisbury 

Cathedral School, Chafyn Grove and 

Godolphin, as well as Bishop Wordsworth and 

South Wilts Grammar Schools. There are 

many places of interest to visit in the locality 

such as the Longleat Estate, Old Wardour 

Castle, Sherborne Castle, Stourhead 

Gardens, Wilton House and Stonehenge. 

 

 

 

 

 

Warminster also benefits from a main line 

railway station to London Waterloo or 

Paddington (80 mins) and Bristol (60mins) 

whilst the nearby A303 provides excellent 

road links to London to the east, Exeter to 

the west and Bristol airport to the north-

west. 
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