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AGENTS NOTE: The heating system, mains and appliances have not been tested by Hearnes Estate Agents. Any areas, 

measurements or distances are approximate. The text, photographs and plans are for guidance only and are not necessarily 

comprehensive. We endeavour to make our sales particulars as accurate as possible.  However, their accuracy is not 

guaranteed and we have not had sight of the title documents.  The buyer is advised to obtain verification from their solicitor 

in respect of the tenure of the property. 

 

7 East Avenue, Talbot Woods, Bournemouth, Dorset, BH3 7BP 

 

A simply stunning detached family home positioned in a prime location within 
the prestigious area of Talbot Woods. Situated on a spectacular and 
beautifully landscaped, secluded plot the property provides easy access to 
Bournemouth town centre and its award-winning sandy beaches, 
Westbourne and The West Hants tennis and health club.  
 
Upon entering the property a most impressive panelled hallway leads to all 
ground floor accommodation and offers stairs leading to the first floor. There 
are three generous, bright reception rooms and additional study with 
outlooks over the rear garden. The impressive open plan kitchen/dining room 
with a stunning kitchen including high quality integral appliances and 
contrasting granite work top. There is access to the rear garden via both the 
kitchen and family room with outdoor seating areas overlooking a heated 
swimming pool, a perfect spot to relax in the evening or dine al fresco. Within 
the kitchen there is an integral utility cupboard with space for washing 
machine and tumble dryer. The ground floor is completed with a cloakroom.  
 
On the first floor an impressive landing provides access to all five bedrooms 
and the family bathroom. The master bedroom is a large double room with 
adjoining ensuite leading to a large balcony that shares access with bedroom 
three. Bedroom two is another spacious double with a beautifully refitted 
ensuite and dressing room. The remaining three bedrooms all with pleasant 
outlooks over the rear garden are served by a luxury re-fitted family bathroom 
room.  
 
A feature of the property is the spectacular gardens, with the property being 
positioned on a large and secluded plot. The rear garden is private and 
beautifully landscaped with an extensive patio sun terrace, overlooking the 
heated swimming pool. The spacious level lawn is bordered by mature shrub 
boarders offering a high degree of privacy. 
 
The driveway is accessed via gates and provides ample off road parking 
leading to a heated garage and ample off road parking for multiple vehicles.  
 
COUNCIL TAX BAND: G                                 EPC RATING: D 

 

 

  

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

  

  

 



 

 

 



 

 

  

  

 



www.hearnes.com 

122 Old Christchurch Road, Bournemouth, Dorset BH1 1LU 

Tel: 01202 317317   Email: bournemouth@hearnes.com 

 

OFFICES ALSO AT: FERNDOWN, POOLE, RINGWOOD & WIMBORNE 

 

 

 

 

  


